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ABSTRACT 
 

Background:  Breast cancer is a major public health problem. It represents the first female cancer 
which creates physical, psychological and social disorders. 
Objectives: This study aimed to describe the perception of the self-esteem and the body image of 
women reached by breast cancer in the hospital of Habib Bourguiba of Sfax – Tunisia during three 
months.  
Methods: It is a cross-sectional observational study. Two measure scales of beforehand designed 
and validated were administered to 125 patients treated for breast cancer: a scale estimating the 
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body image according to Hopwood and a scale estimating the self-esteem according to 
Rosenberg.  
Results: 79% of the investigated women had weak self-esteem and 62% had a distress of the 
body image. Our study also showed that there is a statistically significant correlation between the 
perception of the body image and the self-esteem. The presence of history of psychiatric 
pathologies (P=0,007) and alopecia (p=0,006) are statistically correlated to a body image distress. 
Civil status (p=0,025) and alopecia (p=0,014) statistically impacted the perception of self-esteem.  
Conclusion: In order to improve the quality of life of women with breast cancer, healthcare 
professionals should take into consideration the psychological effect of the consequences of this 
disease. 
 

 
Keywords: Breast cancer; self-esteem; body-image; women. 
 
1. INTRODUCTION 
 
Breast cancer is the second most common 
cancer in the world and, by far the most frequent 
cancer among women with an estimated 1.67 
million new cancer cases diagnosed in 2012 [1].  
 
Western literature reports various incidences of 
breast cancer among women under 35 years old, 
which may reach 4% [2].  
 
Breast cancer is also the most common cancer 
among women in Tunisia. The incidence of this 
disease is close to 30 new cases per 100 000 
women per year. It is estimated that it will affect 
one in 27 women during their lifetime. Besides, it 
is often diagnosed at a late stage with an 
important tumor size [3]. 
 
Diagnosis and treatment of breast cancer affect 
women physically and also cause emotional 
stress. All sorts of treatments (surgery, 
chemotherapy, radiation therapy, hormonal 
therapy) could induce a change in their 
appearance. These changes may be in short 
term or long term [4]. 
 
Body image is defined commonly as a subjective 
picture of an individual’s own physical 
appearance established by self observation and 
by noting the reactions of others [5]. However, 
body image also includes an attitude of 
satisfaction or dissatisfaction with one’s body that 
varies according to two factors: Investment in 
appearance, which concerns an individual’s view 
on the importance of his or her appearance, and 
self-evaluation, which relates to cultural ideals for 
physical appearance and beauty and the 
discrepancy between perceived body image and 
these ideals [6]. 
 
Women who are treated for breast cancer are 
exposed to marked changes in their physical 

appearance, such as loss of part or both breasts, 
scars from surgery, and skin changes related to 
radiotherapy. Furthermore, systemic treatments 
with chemotherapy or hormonal therapy often 
lead to an increased body weight [7,8]. These 
changes are related intimately to physical 
appearance and body image.  
 
Body image is linked closely to identity, self-
esteem, attractiveness, sexual functioning, and 
social relationships [9].   
 
Furthermore, the way one feels about oneself 
crucially affects all aspects of the life 
experiences. Self-esteem constitutes the key to 
the success or failure of a person and to 
understanding him/herself and others. It also 
reflects the ability to cope with life’s challenges, 
to respect and defend one’s own interests and 
requirements [10]. Psychological research has 
documented that body image problems are 
associated with poor self-esteem, social anxiety, 
self-consciousness, and depressive symptoms 
[11].  
 
In Tunisia, although breast cancer is the first 
female cancer, studies on body image and self-
esteem among women with breast cancer have 
not been published. 
 
We aim to describe the perception of both self-
esteem and image of the body among women 
with breast cancer at the department of Medical 
Oncology at Habib Bourguiba University hospital 
in Tunisia, and to determine the factors 
associated with such perceptions. 
 
2. METHODS 
 
2.1 Population of the Study 
 
This observational, cross-sectional, quantitative 
study, was carried out at the Department of 



 
 
 
 

Ghali et al.; JAMMR, 23(4): 1-12, 2017; Article no.JAMMR.35567 
 
 

 
3 
 

Medical Oncology of the University Hospital 
Habib Bourguiba, Sfax – Tunisia.  
 
An active search for women who had breast 
cancer presenting to the outpatient clinic during 
three months period, from February 15th to May 
17th, 2016 was performed. 
 
All outpatients’ women whose breast cancer was 
histologically confirmed who were under 
treatment (chemotherapy, radiation therapy or 
hormonal therapy), and who agreed to participate 
in the study through understanding and      
signing the consent form, were included in our 
study. Women unable to respond (no-
cooperating, deaf…), and women hospitalized    
at the department were excluded from this  
study.  
 
2.2 Conduct of the Study and Collection 

of Data 
 
The questionnaire was distributed and patients 
responded by themselves. The investigator 
interfered only at the request of the respondent 
to explain some of the questions. Every woman 
contacted was briefly made aware of the 
objectives of the study while insisting on the 
anonymity and confidentiality of data.  
 
Three instruments were used for the data 
collection. The first, constructed by the 
researchers of this study, considered the 
demographic and clinical data of the women 
included in our study. The second, the 
Rosenberg Scale [12] was applied to evaluate 
the self-esteem. This is a self-administered scale 
and consists of ten questions with the following 
response options: strongly agree, agree, 
disagree and strongly disagree. Furthermore, in 
order to calculate the total score, we add the 
values assigned to each item according to the 
Likert scale. Given that the various items are not 
formulated in the same direction, the calculation 
of the score will be the sum of the values of the 
items 1, 3, 4, 7 and 10 and the inverted values of 
items 2, 5, 6, 8 and 9. The total score varies from 
10 to 40. For the classification of self-esteem, all 
the items are summed, which provides a single 
value for the scale. According to the total, 
perception of self-esteem can be rated as very 
high (score greater than 39 points), high (score 
between 34 and 39 points), average (score 
between 31 and 34 points), low (score between 
25 and 31 points), and very low (scores below 25 
points). The greater the overall score, the higher 
the self-esteem.  

Subsequently, the Body Image Scale (BIS) is a 
10-item, self-rating scale that was developed to 
ascertain changes in the body image of cancer 
patients [13]. Five BIS items concerned general 
body image issues: feeling self-conscious, 
dissatisfied when dressed, difficulty looking at 
yourself naked, avoid others because of 
appearance, and dissatisfied with body. The 
other 5 BIS items concerned body image in 
relation to the cancer experience: less physically 
attractive, less feminine, less sexually attractive, 
body less whole, and dissatisfied with scar. The 
answer to each item is done according to a 4-
point Likert scale respectively as follows: 0, not 
at all; 1, a little; 2, quite a bit; and 3, very much. 
Higher scores represent poorer body image. The 
total score varies from 10 to 40. As well if the 
score varies between 25 and 40, we talk about 
poorer body image score. On the other hand if 
the score is below 25, we talk about better body 
image score. 
 
For the needs of the study, a translation of both 
scales was done by two sworn interpreters. One 
has ensured the translation of the French version 
to the Arabic version and the other from the 
Arabic version to the French version. The audit of 
the concordance of the items has been carried 
out by a group of experts represented by a 
gynaecologist, a psychologist, a psychiatrist, an 
oncologist and an epidemiologist. Internal 
consistencies were α= 0.94 for BIS and α=0.92 
for the self-esteem scale, reflecting a good 
internal consistency of the two measurement 
instruments. 
 
2.3 Statistical Analysis 
 
The statistical analysis was performed using the 
software "Microsoft Excel 2016" and the 
Software Program Statistical Package for the 
Social Sciences (SPSS) version 23. It included a 
calculation of simple and relative frequencies 
(percentages) for each of the qualitative 
variables, and a calculation of the averages and 
of the medians and standard deviations for 
quantitative variables. In order to test statistically 
crosses made between certain variables, we 
used the test of χ 2 and the t test of Student for 
the comparison of the averages. 
 
The perceptions of the image of the body and the 
self-esteem were expressed through the 
calculation of overall scores. 
 
Univariate analyses were performed to compare 
women with better body image score versus 
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those with a poorer body image score according 
to the different socio-demographic and clinical 
variables, and to compare women having self-
esteem more than average versus those with a 
low self-esteem. The level of significance was set 
at P < 0.05. Finally, the correlation of "Pearson" 
has been used to study the relationship between 
the perception of the image of the body and that 
of the self-esteem. 
 
3. RESULTS 
 
3.1 Sociodemographic Characteristics 

(Table 1) 
 
In total, 125 women have been included. The 
mean age was 49.56±10.59 years, which varied 
from 26 to 71 years. The majority (62.4%) were 
in the age group 35-55 years. 67% of the women 
were married. A primary level education was 
found in 52.8% of cases. Our patients were 
housewives in 67.2% of cases. 46% of 
participants had an average socio-economic 
level. Almost half of the women (57%) were of 
urban origin. 
 

3.2 Medical History (Table 1) 
 
The history of breastfeeding has been found in 
66% of patients. The family history of breast 
cancer has been noted in 55 patients, which was 
in 53% of cases among first-degree relatives 
(aunt, cousin...). A history of psychiatric 
pathologies was noted in 12% of the women, 
among which, the depression was present in 
80% of cases. 
 

3.3 Clinical Characteristics (Table 2) 
 
Mean time to first consultation was 56.37 ± 49.03 
months. 96% of the patients had undergone 
surgery. Most of the women underwent unilateral 
radical surgery (90%). For the 30% of women 
who underwent a conservative treatment, the 
aspect of the remaining breast was not 
satisfactory in 72% of cases. 99.2% of the 
women underwent adjuvant chemotherapy, 
72.8% received radiation therapy, and 49.6% 
hormonal therapy. Most frequent adverse effects 
of chemotherapy were alopecia in 46.8% of 
cases and nausea and/or vomiting in 48.4% of 
cases.  

Table 1. Sociodemographic and medical history chara cterization of our study group 
 

Characteristics  Number (n)  Frequency (%)  
Sociodemographic  
Age group (in years) 
(n=125) 

< 35 years 12 9.6 
35 – 55 years 78 62.4 
> 55 years 35 24 

Marital status 
(n=125) 

Married 84 67 
Divorced 11 9 
Single 16 13 
Widow 14 11 

Level of education 
(n=125) 

University 7 5.6 
Secondary 36 28.8 
Primary 66 52.8 
Never educated 16 12.8 

Socioeconomic level 
(n=125) 

Low 49 39 
Moderate 58 46 
High 18 15 

Geographical origin 
(n=125) 

Rural 54 43 
Urban 71 57 

Medical history  
Breastfeeding 
(n=125) 

Yes 82 66 
No 43 34 

Family history of breast 
cancer 
(n=55; 44%) 

First degree relatives 66 53 
Other relatives 59 47 

Psychiatric pathologies 
(n=15; 12%) 

Depression 12 80 
Hallucination 2 13 
Acute stress 1 7 
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3.4 Perception of the Body Image          
(Table 3)  

 
The average score for body image perception 
was 28.33±8.52. 62% had poor body image 
(score between 25 and 40). More than the 1/3 of 
the patients has responded "very much" on the 
item 7" Did you avoid people because of the way 
you felt about your appearance? "And on the 
item 10 " Have you been dissatisfied with the 
appearance of your scar(s)?".  
 
3.5 Perception of the Self-esteem        

(Table 4) 
 
The average score for self-esteem perception 
was of 23.59±8.19. 78.4% of the women had low 
self-esteem (score < 31). 61% of the patients 
responded "strongly disagree" on the item 7 "I 
feel that I’m a person of worth, at least on an 
equal plane with others". 44% responded 
"disagree" for the item 3 " I feel that I have a 
number of good qualities". 
 
3.6 Factors Influencing the Perception of 

the Body Image (Table 5)  
 
3.6.1  Comparison between poorer and better 

body image according to 
sociodemographic and medical history 
characteristics  

 
The groups with poorer and better body image 
did not differ significantly on demographic 
variables. In fact, although in terms of relative 
frequencies, it seems that poorer body image is 
more frequent among single women aged less 
than 55 years old, having secondary or university 
level of schooling and those of urban origin, the 
difference was not statistically significant. 
 

Concerning medical history variables, a greater 
proportion of women who had a poorer body 
image had history of psychiatric pathologies 
(18.2% versus 2.1% among better body image). 
This difference was statistically significant 
(p=0.007). However, no significant difference has 
been revealed on family histories of breast 
cancer and on the history of breastfeeding.  
 
3.6.2  Comparison between poorer and better 

body image according to clinical 
characteristics  

 
A greater proportion of women who had a better 
body image had a longer mean time to first 
consultation (66.15±47.65 months versus 
50.27±49.20 months among those with poorer 
body image) without indicating statistically 
significant difference between the two groups (p= 
0.077). 
 
We have not noticed a statistically significant 
difference between the two groups according to 
the type of surgical treatment (p=0,871). 
 
In addition, the non satisfaction about the 
appearance of the remaining breast in case of 
conservative surgery was observed in 55.6% of 
the women with better body image versus 81% of 
the other group. However, this difference was not 
significant (p=0.159). Furthermore, while the 
exposure to the hormonal therapy has no      
effect on the perception of the image of the    
body, we have found that poorer body image    
was significantly more frequent in women   
treated by radiotherapy compared to those      
who have not been exposed to this type of 
treatment. The comparison according to 
exposure to chemotherapy was not possible 
because only 1 patient did not receive 
chemotherapy. 
 

Table 2. Clinical characterization of women with bre ast cancer 
 

Variables   Number (n)  Frequency (%)  
Type of treatment 
(n=125) 

Chemotherapy Yes 124 99.2 
No 1 0.8 

Radiotherapy Yes 91 72.8 
No 34 27.2 

Hormonal therapy Yes 62 49.6 
No 63 50.4 

Surgery Yes 120 96 
No 5 4 

Type of surgery (n=120) Conservative 36 30 
Mastectomy 84 70 

Side of mastectomy (n=84) Unilateral 75 90 
Bilateral 9 10 



 
 
 
 

Ghali et al.; JAMMR, 23(4): 1-12, 2017; Article no.JAMMR.35567 
 
 

 
6 
 

Table 3. Response frequency for individual items of  the body image scale 
 

Item Not at 
all (%) 

A little 
(%) 

Quite a 
bite (%) 

Very much 
(%) 

1.Have you been feeling self-conscious about 
your appearance  

9.2 24.8 26.4 37.6 

2. Have you felt less physically attractive as a 
result of your disease or treatment? 

10.4 32 24 33.6 

3. Have you been dissatisfied with your 
appearance when dressed? 

16 26.4 20.8 36.8 

4. Have you been feeling less feminine as a 
result of your disease or treatment? 

19.2 23.2 24.8 32.8 

5. Did you find it difficult to look at yourself 
naked? 

20 24.8 19.2 36 

6. Have you been feeling less sexually attractive 
as a result of your disease or treatment? 

8.8 32 27.2 32 

7. Did you avoid people because of the way you 
felt about your appearance? 

14.4 24 23.2 38.4 

8. Have you been feeling the treatment has left 
your body less whole? 

8.8 31.2 24 36 

9. Have you been dissatisfied with your body? 12 23.2 32 32.8 
10. Have you been dissatisfied with the 
appearance of your scar(s)? 

9.4 20.8 29.6 40 

 
Our study showed a significant difference 
between the two groups according to the 
existence of the alopecia as an adverse effect of 
chemotherapy (p = 0.006). In fact, the frequency 
of the alopecia is statistically higher among 
women with poorer body image (56.6%)         
than among those with better body image 
(31.3%). 
 
3.7 Factors Influencing the Perception of 

Self-esteem (Table 6) 
 
3.7.1 Comparison between low and more  

than the average self-esteem according 
to sociodemographic and medical 
history characteristics  

 
Among the socio-demographic characteristics 
studied, the univariate analysis shows significant 
difference only for the civil status. In fact, it is 
clear that the presence of the partner was 
significantly higher among women with a medium 
or high self-esteem (85.2%) than among those 
with a low self-esteem (62.2%) (p=0.025). 
 
No significant difference was found between 
women with a low self-esteem and the other 
group according to the presence of the history of 
psychiatric pathologies, family history of breast 
cancer and a history of breast feeding. 

3.7.2  Comparison between Low and More 
than the average self-esteem according 
to clinical characteristics  

  
According to the average time elapsed since the 
discovery of the disease, the comparison of the 
perception of the self-esteem has shown a higher 
time among women with a self-esteem more than 
average (average duration= 70.04±47.43 
months) than among those with a low self-
esteem (average duration = 52.60±49.04 
months) without having indicated statistically 
significant difference between the two groups (p= 
0.102). 
 
We have not noticed a statistically significant 
difference between women with a self-esteem 
more than average and women having a low self-
esteem depending on the type of surgical 
treatment indicated (p=0.668). 
 
In addition, the non satisfaction to the 
appearance of the breast remaining in case of 
conservative surgery was observed in 55.6% 
women with a self-esteem more than average 
against 77.8% of those with a low self-esteem 
without being statistically significant (p=0.226). 
 
In addition, exposure to the endocrine therapy 
and to radiotherapy had no effect on the 
perception of the self-esteem. 
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Table 4. Response frequency for individual items of  the self-esteem scale 
 

Item Strongly 
agree (%) 

Agree  
(%) 

Disagree 
(%) 

Strongly 
disagree 
(%) 

1. On the whole, I am satisfied with myself. 20.8 21.6 36.8 20.8 
2. At times I think I am no good at all. 19.2 24.8 29.6 26.4 
3. I feel that I have a number of good 
qualities. 

18.4 20 44 17.6 

4. I am able to do things as well as most 
other people. 

19.2 19.2 36 25.6 

5. I feel I do not have much to be proud of. 17.6 20 33.6 28.8 
6. I certainly feel useless at times. 17.6 29.6 28.8 24 
7. I feel that I'm a person of worth, at least on 
an equal plane with others. 

0 0 39.2 60.8 

8. I wish I could have more respect for 
myself. 

15.2 25.6 32.8 26.4 

9. All in all, I am inclined to feel that I am a 
failure. 

18.4 18.4 37.6 25.6 

10. I take a positive attitude toward myself. 20.8 22.4 33.6 23.2 
 

Table 5. Evaluation of the body image according to sociodemographic, medical history and 
clinical characteristics 

 
Characteristics  Better body 

image (n=48) 
(%) 

Poorer body 
image (n=77) 
(%) 

P 

Sociodemographic  
Age group  
 

< 35 years 3 (6.3) 9 (11.7)  
NS 35 – 55 years 28 (58.3) 50 (64.9) 

> 55 years 17 (35.4) 18 (23.4) 
Marital status With partner 37 (77.1) 47 (61) NS 

Without partner 11 (22.9) 30 (39) 
Level of 
education 

University+ Secondary 14 (29.2) 29 (37.7)  
NS Never educated +Primary 34 (70.8) 48 (62.3) 

Socioeconomic 
level 

Low 26 (54.2) 50 (64.9)  
NS Moderate+ High 22 (45.8) 27 (35.1) 

Geographical 
origin 

Rural 22 (45.8) 32 (41.6)  
NS Urban 26 (54.2) 45 (58.4) 

Medical histo ry  
Family history of 
breast cancer 

Yes 23 (47.9) 32 (41.6)  
NS No 25 (52.1) 45 (58.4) 

Psychiatric 
Pathologies 

Yes 1 (2.1) 14 (18.2)  
0.007 No 47 (97.9) 63 (81.8) 

Breastfeeding 
 

Yes 34 (70.8) 48 (62.3)  
NS No 14 (29.2) 29 (37.7) 

Clinical data  
Endocrine treatment Yes 26 (54.2) 36 (46.8)  

NS No 22 (45.8) 41 (53.2) 
Radiotherapy Yes 40 (83.3) 51 (66.2)  

0.037 No 8 (16.7) 26 (33.8) 
 Better body 

image (n=48) 
Poorer body 
image (n=72)  

P 

Mastectomy 34 (70.8) 50 (69.4) NS 
Conservative treatment 14 (29.2) 22 (30.6) 

NS: No significant difference 
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Table 6. Evaluation of the self-esteem according to  sociodemographic, medical history and 
clinical characteristics 

 
Characteristics  More than the 

average self-
esteem (n=27) (%) 

Low self -esteem  
 (n=98) (%) 

P 

Sociodemographic  
 
Age group  
 

< 35 years 3 (11.1) 9 (9.2)  
NS 35 – 55 years 13 (48.2) 65 (66.3) 

> 55 years 11 (40.7) 24 (24.5) 
 
Marital status 

With partner 23 (85.2) 61 (62.2) 0.025 
Without partner 4 (14.8) 37 (37.8) 

Level of education University+ Secondary 23 (85.2) 61 (62.2)  
NS Never educated +Primary 4 (14.8) 37 (37.8) 

Socioeconomic 
level 

Low 23 (85.2) 61 (62.2)  
NS Moderate+ High 4 (14.8) 37 (37.8) 

Geographical 
origin 

Rural 23 (85.2) 61 (62.2)  
NS Urban 4 (14.8) 37 (37.8) 

Medical history  
Family history of 
breast cancer 

Yes 12 (44.4) 43 (43.9)  
NS No 15 (55.6) 55 (56.1) 

Psychiatric 
Pathologies 

Yes 0 (0) 15 (15.3)  
NS No 27 (100) 83 (84,7) 

Breastfeeding 
 

Yes 19 (70.4) 63 (64.3)  
NS No 8 (29.6) 35 (35.7) 

Clinical  data  
Endocrine treatment Yes 14 (51.9) 48 (49)  

NS No 13 (48.1) 50 (51) 
Radiotherapy Yes 19 (70.4) 72 (73.5)  

NS No 8 (29.6) 26 (26.5) 
 More than the 

average self-
esteem (n=27) 

Low self -esteem 
(n=93) 

P 

Mastectomy 18 (66.7) 66 (71) NS 
Conservative treatment 9 (33.3) 27 (29) 

NS: No significant difference 
 
Our study showed a significant difference 
between the two groups according to the 
existence of the alopecia as an adverse effect of 
chemotherapy (p = 0.014). In fact, the frequency 
of the Alopecia is statistically higher among 
women with a low self-esteem (52.6%) than 
among those with self-esteem more than 
average (25.9%). 
 
3.8 Pearson’s Correlation between the 

Perception of Self –esteem and Body 
Image 

 
Our study showed that there is a statistically 
significant correlation between the perception of 
the image of the body and that of the self-
esteem. Thus the higher the score of body 
image, the lower the score of the perception of 
the self-esteem (Pearson’s correlation coefficient 
= -0.444, p<10-3).  

4. DISCUSSION 
 
4.1 Perception of the Body Image  
 
Schilder defines the image of the body as "the 
way our body appears to us" [14]. 
 
Patients with breast cancer present an alteration 
of the body image that is expressed in several 
dimensions: Social relations, physical well-being 
and self-esteem [15]. 
 
A poorer body image score was noticed in 62% 
of women. This proportion was lower in the study 
of Dahl et al. [16]. In fact seventy-six breast 
cancer survivors (31%) had poorer body image in 
2004, and sixty-seven (27%) in 2007. Among 
those 76 survivors who had a poorer body image 
in 2004, 52 survivors (68%) also had a poorer 
body image in 2007, whereas 24 survivors (32%) 
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had changed to a better body image. Among the 
172 BCSs who had a better body image in 2004, 
15 survivors (9%) had changed to a poorer body 
image in 2007, whereas 157 survivors (91%) 
retained a better body image over time. 
 
In our study, no significant difference was found 
between poorer and better body image according 
to sociodemographic characteristics.  
 
Marques et al. [17] found, as in our study, no 
significant association between image of the 
body and age (p=0.20). However, in 2001, 
Hopwood et al. [13] noticed that young women 
had a better body image. Bredart et al. [18] have 
also highlighted more important concerns of the 
body image among young patients. 
 
Besides, concerning the civil status, Francisco    
et al. [19] affirmed that single women were more 
distressed by their body image (p=0.03). The 
marital status had no impact on the body image 
in our survey. 
 
In our study, a greater proportion of women who 
had a poorer body image had a history of 
psychiatric pathologies (18.2% versus 2.1% 
among better body image). This difference was 
statistically significant (p=0.007). In Hannoun’s 
study [20], a quarter of the women treated for 
breast cancer took a treatment for anxiety, 
depression or both. These disorders destabilize 
the psychic homeostasis of women and therefore 
disrupt the image they had of their bodies. 
Moreover, according to Dahl et al. [16], poorer 
body image was associated with poorer self-
rated health, chronic fatigue and mental distress, 
and poorer generic and disease-related quality of 
life in univariate analyses. Most of these 
variables also significantly predicted poorer body 
image 3 years later. 
 
As in our study, Marques et al. [17] found no 
significant association between the perception of 
the body image and the time elapsed since the 
discovery of the disease. Bredart et al. [18] have 
noted a poorer body image beyond 6 months 
after surgery by comparison to the first six 
months following this intervention. However, 
Hopwood et al. [13] have found higher scores on 
the scale of body image at the end of the first six 
months after the date of the first surgical 
intervention. 
 
The survey made by Shover et al. [21], on a 
large group of women, confirmed that quality of 
life was minimally affected when a partial 

mastectomy or immediate breast reconstruction 
was performed. The great majority of women 
were well adjusted psychologically, rated their 
sexual attractiveness positively, had happy 
marital relationships, and were satisfied with their 
sex lives. Concerning all of these dimensions, 
less than 20% of women reported significant 
distress. 
 
In addition to the systemic treatment, surgical 
treatment affects the image of the body. 
Vanlerenberghe et al. [22] affirmed that 
mastectomy, when it is indicated, is experienced 
as a mutilation and an alteration of the female 
identity and the body image. Of all time, breast 
has always been a symbol of femininity. In daily 
life, the absence of the breast and the 
dissymmetry are very binding: fear of losing the 
prosthesis, fear to be surprised nude in the 
bathroom, etc. The nudity may be difficult to 
assume and become particularly stressful. Two 
types of pain can occur after breast surgery: 
phantom breast pain and post mastectomy pain 
syndrome [23]. 
 
Marques et al. [17], have found a better body 
image score among women who underwent 
radical surgery than among women who had 
conservative one. This confirms that the 
evaluation of the body image allows 
differentiating groups of surgery characterized by 
appearance changes. However, Shover et al. 
[21] reported that conservative treatment can 
cause more distress of the body image than a 
radical treatment (p<0.001). In fact, 88% of 
patients who had a conservative treatment were 
not satisfied with the appearance of their breast. 
According to Shover, women who had partial 
mastectomy and those who underwent breast 
reconstruction were similar on dimensions of 
psychosocial adjustment and body image, 
suggesting that the choice of the treatment 
should be based on medical factors but also on 
aesthetic outlook [21]. 
 
In the study of Dahl et al. [16], a significantly 
greater proportion of women who underwent 
breast reconstruction were among the breast 
cancer survivors with the poorer body image. 
58% of breast cancer survivors who were treated 
with both modified radical mastectomy and 
manually planned radiotherapy had a better body 
image. 
 
Vanlerenberghe et al. [22] have found that 
radiotherapy alters the perception of the image of 
the body. The skin is infiltrated, loses its 
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flexibility, and the breast is painful forbidding any 
contact, patients often complains of burning 
sensations. 
  
More common adverse events of hormonal 
therapy are weight gain (progestin), lot flushes 
(oestrogen inhibitors, aromatase inhibitors), 
vaginal dryness and atrophy, bone pain and 
arthralgia (aromatase inhibitors). This treatment 
alters the image of the body and the quality of  
life of some patients [22]. However, in our study 
the association endocrine therapy and the 
perception of the image of the body were not 
significant. 
 
In addition, in our study we found a correlation 
between the perception of the image of the body 
and alopecia caused by chemotherapy (p=0.006) 
which is consistent with the result found in the 
study of Shover (p<0.001) [21]. 
 
4.2 Perception of the Self-esteem 
 
Our patients had a low self-esteem in 78.4% of 
cases with a mean score of 23.59±8.19. In the 
study of Shover et al. [21] 29% of women had a 
low self-esteem. 
 
According to Gomes et al. [24], the minimum 
score obtained was 19 points and the maximum 
40, with a mean of 30.32± 4.58. Only one woman 
(2.7%) presented low self-esteem, 16 women 
(43.2%) had average self-esteem and 20 women 
(54.1%) high self-esteem.  
 
In our series, being married significantly affects 
the perception of the self-esteem (p = 0.025). 
Similarly Gomes et al. [24] have shown that 11   
of the 20 women with high self-esteem score   
had stable unions (It should be noted that     
those married or living with a steady partner   
were considered to be in a stable union).         
The presence of the partner has been shown      
to be significant in fighting the disease            
and facilitated her family and social reintegration 
[25]. 
 
According to Gomes et al. [24] there is a 
significant relationship between age and self-
esteem. The prevalence of high self-esteem can 
be explained by the mean age of the 
respondents (56.11 years), as self-esteem tends 
to increase with age [26]. This has also been 
found by Johansson      et al. [27], they reported 
that being a single female, aged between 26 and 
63 years and still working despite the disease, 
foster a strong self-esteem.  

In our study, no correlation between the 
perception of the self-esteem and the level of 
instruction was noted. However, Gomes et al. 
[24], have shown a positive correlation between 
educated women and a high self-esteem 
(p<0.05). It is assumed that the higher the level 
of education, the greater the access to 
information and, consequently, the greater the 
understanding of the situation. Women start to 
value the fact that they are survivors of breast 
cancer and attach less value to their body image. 
They feel more peaceful, secure and confident, 
which reflect positively in their self-esteem [24]. 
 
As in our study, Gomes et al. [24], found no 
significant difference between low and more than 
the average self-esteem according to the type of 
treatment. The majority of the women in both 
groups presented high self-esteem, with the 
percentages being equivalent. Moreover, 
concerning the complementary treatments, 
among the seven women who underwent 
neoadjuvant chemotherapy, four (54.15%) 
presented average self-esteem and three 
(42.85%) high self-esteem. Among the 15 who 
underwent adjuvant chemotherapy, one (6.67%) 
presented low self-esteem, six (40%) average 
self esteem, and eight (53.33%) high self-
esteem. Of the eighteen women who underwent 
radiotherapy, nine (50%) presented average self-
esteem, nine (50%) high self-esteem and, finally, 
of the 29 who underwent endocrine therapy, 12 
(41.4%) presented average self-esteem and 17 
(58.6%) high self-esteem. Two patients who did 
not receive neither chemotherapy nor hormonal 
therapy had high self-esteem [24]. 
 
These findings are not in line with some studies 
[28,29]. In Vieira and in Tavares studies, radical 
surgery affected the self-esteem and body image 
of the patients and was cited as a source of 
emotional and physical distancing between 
woman with mastectomy and her partner [24]. It 
was noted that if surgery was performed on the 
dominant side, the self-esteem scores tended to 
be lower. Indeed, lymphodema could hinder the 
return to normal daily activity and normal 
relationships [30]. 
 
In our study, women exposed to chemotherapy-
induced alopecia had lower self-esteem (p = 
0.014).  
 
Despite knowing that chemotherapy and 
hormonal therapy negatively influence the quality 
of life of patients and their self-esteem, due to 
the adverse effects (decreased physical function, 
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role performance and body image, and increased 
symptoms of anxiety, fatigue, nausea, vomiting 
and constipation) [31], the study of Gomes et al. 
[24] did not encounter this result. 
 
Also known as ‘reverse mastectomy’, breast 
reconstruction is considered the most effective 
method for the restoration of the psychological 
well-being after mastectomy. It improves the 
body outline, preserves or restores the personal 
integrity, increases optimism for a cure, and 
contributes to sexual identification, thus 
increasing the self-esteem and improving the 
body image [32]. However, for other women, 
breast reconstruction is not desired, even when it 
is encouraged by the doctors [33]. 
 
4.3 Pearson’s Correlation between the 

Perception of Self –esteem and Body 
Image 

 
The reliability of the body image scale is 
satisfactory (Cronbach alpha = 0.941). This 
result is in line with what was found by Brédart et 
al. [18] (Cronbach's alpha= 0.93) [19]. In the 
study of Vallieres et Vallerand, the Cronbach 
alpha values is equal to 0.89 for the self-esteem 
scale. This result was consistent with ours 
(0.929) reflecting a good internal consistency of 
the items [34]. 
 
5. CONCLUSION  
 
The results found in our study highlighted the 
magnitude of the psychological pain experienced 
by women with breast cancer. This type of 
cancer requires an appropriate holistic support 
(biopsychosocial) to ensure a better quality of 
life. Despite the importance of the sufferance, 
and the impact of this pathology on the 
psychosocial life of the woman, few studies have 
addressed this topic. Therefore, it is important to 
initiate researches in this subject in order to 
improve the wellbeing of women with breast 
cancer. 
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